
BID TABULATION
Traffic Signal Equipment

Bid #PUR0420-195

May 15, 2020 at 3:00pm

Line Item Description Qty Price Extended Price Extended

Dialight 12" red ball XL15, tinted lens 360 $50.00 $18,000.00 no bid

Dialight 12" yellow ball XL15, tinted lens 360 $52.00 $18,720.00 no bid

Dialight 12" green ball XL15, tinted lens 360 $50.50 $18,180.00 no bid

Dialight 12" red arrow XOD15, tinted lens 60 $51.00 $3,060.00 no bid

Dialight 12" yellow arrow XOD15, tinted lens 120 $53.50 $6,420.00 no bid

Dialight 12" green arrow XOD15, tinted lens 60 $51.00 $3,060.00 no bid

Total price for Dialight:

3-section 12” black poly signal head with tunnel 

visors, RYG ball Dialight XL15 LED’s 40 $283.00 $11,320.00 no bid

3-section 12” black poly signal head with tunnel 

visors, RY ball G arrow Dialight  XL, XOD15 

LED’s 14 $288.00 $4,032.00 no bid

4-section 12” black poly signal head with tunnel 

visors, RY ball GG arrow Dialight XL, XOD15 

LED’s 4 $395.00 $1,580.00 no bid

4-section 12” black poly signal head with tunnel 

visors, RYYG arrow Dialight XOD15 LED’s
16 $407.00 $6,512.00 no bid

Replacement 12” black poly doors and tunnel 

visors 200 $20.00 $4,000.00 no bid

Replacement 3-section vacuum formed 

backplate 80 $59.00 $4,720.00 $55.75 $4,460.00

Replacement 4-section vacuum formed 

backplate 50 $74.00 $3,700.00 $69.75 $3,487.50

Replacement 5-section vacuum formed 

backplate 10 $85.00 $850.00 $79.75 $797.50

Total price for Eagle:

McCain or Equivalent 12" black visor 45 degree 

left 18" long 60 $52.00 $3,120.00 no bid

McCain or Equivalent 12" black visor 45 degree 

right 18" long 60 $52.00 $3,120.00 no bid

Total price for McCain:

Astro-brac Stellar AS-3009-96-SS clamp kits 48 $88.00 $4,224.00 $80.00 $3,840.00

Skybracket 3 section signal head mounting 

assembly SS-SBC90-TS-46 70 $155.00 $10,850.00 $140.50 $9,835.00

Skybracket 4 section signal head mounting assembly SS-SBC60-TS-6030 $159.00 $4,770.00 $145.00 $4,350.00

Total price for Miscellaneous:

Total amount for all items above:

Manufacturer:

Model:

Warranty:

How long pricing is held for:

Estimated Delivery:

Signature Page

VENDORS

Vendor Location

Local Business Certificate on File (Yes/No)

Mobotrex

Davenport, IA

No

$67,440.00

$36,714.00

see bid

60 days

60 days

$101,124.00

$6,240.00

$19,844.00

see bid

see bid

60 days

Traffic Control 

Corporation

Ankeny, IA

No

$8,745.00

60 days

$18,025.00

$26,770.00

see bid

see bid

see bid
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1 Do You Accept Credit Card for Payment?
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3 Does Discount Apply to MasterCard?

No
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